
Total 
Price $107,600.00

Total 
Price $132,504.00

Total 
Price $64,660.00

Total 
Price $11,600.00

Total 
Price $77,800.00

Total 
Price $65,150.00

Total 
Price $101,000.00

Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1
.40 S&W Speer LE Gold Dot 165 gr. GDHP
NO SUBSTITUTES 5000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.43 $2,150.00 No Bid

2
.223 Federal Duty Tactical .62g  
Bonded Soft Point
NO SUBSTITUTES 10000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.55 $15,500.00 No Bid

3
.223 (Cleanfire) .55g Frangable
NO SUBSTITUTES 30000 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4
.40 Federal .125g Frangible 
SUBSTITUTES ALLOWED 100000 EA No Bid No Bid $0.47 $47,000.00

4 ALT1
40 S&W - 125 Grain Frangible RHFP - 
SinterFire RHA - Bulk Packed Sinterfire SF40125RHA(LP) 100000 EA $0.56

4 ALT1 40SW 135 gr, frangible (500 rds. per case) Winchester RA40SF 100000 EA $0.65 65,000.00$  

4 ALT1 .40 Frangible 125Grn, 500 rounds per case Hornady 91319 200 Case $330.61 66,122.00$    

5
9mm Federal .98g Frangible 
SUBSTITUTES ALLOWED 10000 EA No Bid No Bid $0.49 $4,900.00

5 ALT1 9MM 100 gr. Frangible (500 rds. per case) Winchester RA9SF 10000 EA $0.48 4,800.00$    

5 ALT1
Fiocchi 9mm 100 grain, Frangible Non 
Toxic, 1,000 per case. Fiocchi 9FRANG 10000 EA $0.51 5,100.00$    

5 ALT1
9mm Frangible 90 Grn, 500 rounds per 
case Hornady 90230 20 Case $266.34 5,326.80$      

6
.223 Federal .55g Ball
SUBSTITUTES ALLOWED 30000 EA No Bid $0.49 $14,700.00

6 ALT2 .223 55gr FMJ Ball ArmscorUSA 30000 EA $0.38 11,400.00$  

6 ALT1
Fiocchi Shooting Dynamics Rifle 
Ammunition, 223 Remington 55 Grain 
FMJ 3240FPS 50/Box 1000/Case Fiocchi 223A 30000 EA $0.40 12,000.00$  

6 ALT3 .223 55gr FMJ Ball Igman 30000 EA $0.42 12,600.00$  

6 ALT1
.223 55gr FMJ Ball

Ammo 
Incorporate
d 30000 EA $0.45 13,500.00$  

6 ALT1 .223 55 gr. FMJ (1000 rds. per case) Winchester USA223R1K 30000 EA $0.46 13,800.00$  

6 ALT1
.223 remington, 55gr FMJ Boat tail, 
3240FPS Fiocchi FIO223A 30000 EA $0.51 15,300.00$  

6 ALT1 .223 55 Grn FMJ, 500 rounds per case Hornady 80275 60 Case $309.32 18,559.20$    
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7
.40 Speer .165g Ball 
SUBSTITUTES ALLOWED 80000 EA No Bid $0.38 $30,400.00 $0.43 $34,400.00

7 ALT1
.40 S&W 180gr TMC (TMJ equivalent) Ball

Ammo 
Incorporate
d 80000 EA $0.28 22,400.00$  

7 ALT1
40SW 165 gr. FMJ Flat Nose (500 rds. per 
case) Winchester USA40SW 80000 EA $0.30 24,000.00$  

7 ALT1 .40 SW 175 Grn FMJ, 500 rounds per case Hornady 91374 160 Case $234.35 37,496.00$    
7 ALT1 .40 SW 165gr FMJ, 1050fps Blazer BLA5210 80000 EA $0.52 41,600.00$  

8
Hornady ELD MATCH 168gr - 308 
NO SUBSTITUTES 4000 EA No Bid $1.25 $5,000.00 $1.94 $7,760.00 No Bid $1.75 $7,000.00 No Bid No Bid

9
9mm Securi BlanksLoud & Quiet
NO SUBSTITUTES 10000 EA No Bid No Bid $0.44 $4,400.00 $0.54 $5,400.00 No Bid No Bid

10
223 Securi Blanks Loud and Quiet
NO SUBSTITUTES 10000 EA No Bid No Bid $0.72 $7,200.00 $0.55 $5,500.00 No Bid No Bid
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